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Hey friends, 

I ended last month as a really. 
weary. pupper. 

You could say that I was dog-
tired! 

There were end of the year school 
visits, graduations at our Early 
Childhood Center and Lutheran 
North Academy, and a trip to 
Uvalde. 

I’m glad that I had places to go 
and people to visit, but it was nice 
to get home and rest, too. 

My Jesus talks about being tired 
and resting. 

He says, “Come to me, all who 
labor and are heavy laden, and I 
will give you rest” (Matthew 
11:28). 

My Jesus knows that sometimes 
not just our bodies but our souls are 
weary. 

So He invites us to come to Him 
and take a little snoozle to refresh 
ourselves. 

Maybe that’s when you pray or 
sing hymns or read His Word. 

It’s like taking a nice nap and then 
waking up with a bi-i-ig stre-e-etch, 
something I highly recommend. 

When you’re plumb tuckered out, 
remember that my Jesus promises 
rest for your weary soul. 

Isn’t that PAWSOME?!? 

Your friend Gabriel 

Gabriel’s 
Glad 

Tidings 

Did someone say 
“Squirrel”? 

My friends at Kaufman 
Elementary School 

At Santa Fe High 
School with my 
friend Joy 

Helping hurting 
people in Uvalde 


